
 
 

Teacher – Special Needs 
Outpost Program  

St Stephen’s School - Carramar 
Temporary Part time 

 
• Are you an experienced Special Needs Teacher seeking to join an 

organisation that is committed to evidence-based practice and ongoing 
professional development? 

• Would you embrace the opportunity to learn from a multi-disciplinary 
team of professionals in a family- centred practice? 

• Do you aspire to work in a nurturing and supportive environment that 
makes a difference in the lives of WA children and their families? 

 
Telethon Speech & Hearing (TSH) is a Western Australian not-for-profit 
organisation, registered charity, independent school and NDIS provider 
that has helped children with speech, language and hearing difficulties lead 
fulfilling lives since 1966. 

 

This is a truly unique teaching role working in our Outpost Program which 
provides a comprehensive in-school support for students with hearing loss 
from Kindergarten to Year 12 at our partner primary and secondary schools 
around the Perth Metropolitan area.  The program is designed for students 
who use oral communication to maximise their active participation in 
mainstream schools.  

 
This role works as part of a multi-disciplinary team (including psychologists, 
speech pathologists, audiologists and occupational therapists) where the 
Teacher plays an essential role in delivering high quality and timely 
education support services to children with hearing loss.  
 

 



 

The successful candidate will be an experienced and qualified Special Needs 
Teacher or an experienced Teacher with Teacher of the Deaf qualifications 
(current or working towards) who has the ability to create an inclusive and 
nurturing environment that recognises every person’s unique talent and 
fosters positive outcomes. 

 

Scholarships for Master’s level qualifications are available to Telethon 
Speech & Hearing employees who have aspirations to build a long-term 
career supporting children with hearing loss.  Scholarships are subject to 
terms and conditions and based on a formal selection process.  

 
Telethon Speech & Hearing is committed to providing a child safe 
environment and promoting practices which provide for the safety, wellbeing 
and welfare of our children, clients and families.  Therefore, in addition to the 
above selection criteria, short listed applicants will also be assessed against 
their ability to support and maintain a child safe environment.  

 

This is a temporary part time position for the remainder of 2021.  The 
successful candidate will be employed as an 0.8 FTE (working Monday, 
Tuesday, Thursday and Friday) with the possibility of additional hours and 
contract extension.  

 
For a confidential discussion regarding this opportunity please contact 
Janene Hall, Principal, on 0467 067 505. 
 
To apply, please submit your application via email to hresource@tsh.org.au 
by COB Monday, 12th July 2021. 
 

 
TSH is an equal opportunity employer and we encourage people from 
different backgrounds to apply, including Aboriginal and Torres Strait 

Islander peoples, people from culturally and linguistically diverse (CALD) 
backgrounds and people with disabilities.   


